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Hot rodding has always been about taking something that Detroit built and making it leaner and faster. At the
epicenter of the movement was a cast of driven men who designed and manufactured the parts that made it
all possible.  This book takes an appreciative look back at the early hot rodders who worked out of their
garages, basements, and backyards, and the “speed equipment” they developed. 
 
In this mammoth volume, Paul Smith examines the stories behind two dozen speed equipment manufacturers
and the go-fast goodies they designed, developed, and sold.  Drawing upon hundreds of hours of interviews
conducted with these founding fathers of hot rodding, Smith details the work of industry icons such as
Iskenderian, Edelbrock, Evans, Hilborn, Navarro, Offenhauser, Sharp, Weiand, Ansen, and Kong.  Illustrated
with more than 200 period photos and filled with firsthand accounts of the birth of hot rodding—and the
automotive aftermarket industry—this book is a truly fitting celebration of the names that became
synonymous with speed.
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Steele:

The reason why? Because this Merchants of Speed: The Men Who Built America's Performance Industry is
an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you
with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in
such incredible way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey
the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book possess such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you
I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Charles Shin:

The book untitled Merchants of Speed: The Men Who Built America's Performance Industry contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was written by famous author.
The author brings you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

James Fitzpatrick:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this book. This Merchants of Speed: The Men Who
Built America's Performance Industry is simple bringing you can read it in the park your car, in the beach,
train along with soon. If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the
particular e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Donald Edmond:

As a college student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library
or even make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart
and soul or real their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They
go to at this time there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important,
boring as well as can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very
important for you personally. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want.
Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Merchants of Speed: The Men
Who Built America's Performance Industry can make you feel more interested to read.
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