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The Jump Into Science book, Babies, looks at what babies can and can't do, their development, growth, and
more. It follows a newborn home from the hospital under the watchful gaze of his older sister. As she learns,
we learn. How fast do babies grow? What do they eat? How do we take care of them? Readers will learn
amazing baby facts, such as: Newborns can see only in black-and-white. They taste only sweet, bitter, and
sour, but they like sweet best. And, if you kept growing at the rate that babies grow when they're first born,
you'd weigh more than a thousand pounds by the time you were five! Understanding what's going on with a
baby's development will help older siblings look beyond the cooing and the crying. Kids will find out that
babies like to imitate and that they learn through imitation. A do-it-yourself activity at the end of the book
let's kids be a baby scientist by trying to get a baby to respond to simple gestures and then by recording those
observations on a chart. Kids will be surprised to learn that peek-a-boo is an educational game for a baby!
And they'll see why babies aren't ready for solid food or for walking or talking until they're a little older.The
Babies artwork is charming and funny and clearly directed toward an older sibling in the 4-8 age group. It
follows one family's baby antics - midnight feedings, trying to guess what the crying baby wants - but it also
shows babies of every type and description at the hospital, at the park, and in multiple groups from twins to
septuplets!
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From reader reviews:

Sam Grimes:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Babies: All You Need to Know (Jump Into Science). Try to the actual
book Babies: All You Need to Know (Jump Into Science) as your buddy. It means that it can to get your
friend when you experience alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever before.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

James Peters:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet
and the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How many
people to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Babies: All You Need to Know
(Jump Into Science) book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this
book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Cynthia Miller:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for
you. All those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Babies: All You Need to Know (Jump
Into Science) as the daily resource information.

Marian Carson:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Babies: All
You Need to Know (Jump Into Science) suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in this era.
Often the book untitled Babies: All You Need to Know (Jump Into Science)is the main of several books
which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you
read this book you will enter the new age that you ever know previous to. The author explained their idea in
the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to recognise the core of this e-book. This book will
give you a great deal of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this
book.
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