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Over the past 1,000 years, countless images have been created to depict sound in forms that theoretically
could be "played" just as though they were modern sound recordings. Now, for the first time in history, this
compilation uses innovative digital techniques to convert historic "pictures of sound" dating back as far as
the Middle Ages directly into meaningful audio. It contains the world's oldest known "sound recordings" in
the sense of sound vibrations automatically recorded out of the air--the groundbreaking phonautograms
recorded in Paris by Édouard-Léon Scott de Martinville in the 1850s and 1860s--as well as the oldest
gramophone records available anywhere for listening today, including inventor Emile Berliner's recitation of
"Der Handschuh," played back from an illustration in a magazine, which international news media recently
proclaimed to be the oldest audible "record" in the tradition of 78s and vintage vinyl. Other highlights
include the oldest known recording of identifiable words spoken in the English language (1878) and the
world's oldest surviving "trick recording" (1889). Pictures of Sound pursues the thread even further by
"playing" everything from medieval music manuscripts to historic telegrams, and from seventeenth-century
barrel organ programs to eighteenth-century "notations" of Shakespearean recitation. In short, this isn't just
another collection of historical audio--it redefines what "historical audio" is.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Brown:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts. When you
read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this
Pictures of Sound: One Thousand Years of Educed Audio: 980-1980, you are able to tells your family,
friends and soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a reserve.

Troy Munoz:

Often the book Pictures of Sound: One Thousand Years of Educed Audio: 980-1980 has a lot details on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous
author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you may get
the point easily after reading this article book.

David Barthel:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't
see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Pictures of Sound: One Thousand Years of Educed Audio: 980-1980 can
make you really feel more interested to read.

Leroy Mallett:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or created from each source which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the Pictures of Sound: One Thousand Years of Educed Audio: 980-1980 when you needed it?
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