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One of the more intriguing developments within medieval Japanese literature is the incorporation into the
teaching of waka poetry of the practices of initiation ceremonies and secret transmissions found in esoteric
Buddhism. The main figure in this development was the obscure thirteenth-century poet Fujiwara Tameaki,
grandson of the famous poet Fujiwara Teika and a priest in a tantric Buddhist sect. Tameaki's commentaries
and teachings transformed secular texts such as the Tales of Ise and poetry anthologies such as the Kokin
waka shu into complex allegories of Buddhist enlightenment. These commentaries were transmitted to his
students during elaborate initiation ceremonies. In later periods, Tameaki's specific ideas fell out of vogue,
but the habit of interpreting poetry allegorically continued.

This book examines the contents of these commentaries as well as the qualities of the texts they addressed
that lent themselves to an allegorical interpretation; the political, economic, and religious developments of
the Kamakura period that encouraged the development of this method of interpretation; and the possible
motives of the participants in this school of interpretation. Through analyses of six esoteric commentaries,
Susan Blakeley Klein presents examples of this interpretive method and discusses its influence on
subsequent texts, both elite and popular.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Collier:

This Allegories of Desire: Esoteric Literary Commentaries of Medieval Japan (Harvard-Yenching Institute
Monograph Series) tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main
reason of this Allegories of Desire: Esoteric Literary Commentaries of Medieval Japan (Harvard-Yenching
Institute Monograph Series) can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than
just simple studying food but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your earlier knowledge.
This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and
printed types. Beside that this Allegories of Desire: Esoteric Literary Commentaries of Medieval Japan
(Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich
vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Deborah Browning:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill
your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If
you want to attempt look for book, may be the book untitled Allegories of Desire: Esoteric Literary
Commentaries of Medieval Japan (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) can be fine book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

James Sweeney:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Allegories of Desire: Esoteric
Literary Commentaries of Medieval Japan (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) can be the
response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Bonnie Gallup:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
internal or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you.
As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says,



ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Allegories of Desire: Esoteric Literary Commentaries of Medieval
Japan (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) can make you experience more interested to read.
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