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This book, beautifully illustrated with rare photographs of dervishes, tells the tale of the Sufi order and of
one of its founders, poet and mystic Mevlana Jalalu’ddin Rumi. After Rumi’s death in 1273, the whirling
dance, or sema, was established as part of the Mevlevi’s prayer ritual, and it has been performed by them
ever since. The sema survives to this day, a statement of a timeless and passionate yearning toward God.

With a special section devoted to Mevlevi music and introductions by Annemarie Schimmel and Seyyed
Hossein Nasr, Rumi and the and the Whirling Dervishes offers an unparalleled glimpse into the Mevlevi’s
ecstatic practices.
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From reader reviews:

Christina Evert:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They
are reading whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Rumi and the Whirling Dervishes.

Raymond McMillion:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular Rumi and the Whirling
Dervishes book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Louis Patrick:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you
personally but the problems coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This
Rumi and the Whirling Dervishes is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this
book serves what you want and want in this era.

Dena Ramirez:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This specific Rumi and the Whirling Dervishes can give
you a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you have matter that they don't and make you
actually more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success.
This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than some
other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Rumi and the Whirling
Dervishes.
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