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The only Indonesia travel guide you'll need for getting around Jakarta! Everything you need is in this
one convenient package—including a large pull-out map!

Linking over 500 activities and attractions into 25 half-day and full-day excursions, this is the first in-depth
travel book on Jakarta that tells you exactly where to go, what to do and how to get there in order to
maximize your enjoyment of the city.

Illustrated with over 40 maps and 200 color photographs of the city, the 25 tours take you by the hand from
the maritime and historical attractions of north Jakarta, down the culturally rich back streets of central
Jakarta, to the peaceful parks and family attractions of the south; and on five additional tours outside the city,
exploring mountains, lakes and beaches within easy reach of the capital.

Each tour starts with a description of the neighborhood's key attractions; cultural and historical background
and advice on how to get to the starting point, followed by a step-by-step guide through the walk itself. Tours
include high adventure—scuba diving, paragliding, rock climbing, microlighting, horse riding and wet and
dry market exploration—as well as more traditional visits to art galleries, museums, parks and temples.
Special interest tours include history walks, urban art walks and market walks. Each chapter gives you the
walk length, degree of difficulty and age suitability, so you know exactly what you are getting into before
you start.

This indispensable Jakarta travel guide is jam-packed with practical tips on what to wear, what to bring,
expect and say to the local people you encounter as you explore areas of Jakarta off the beaten path, and re-
explore favorite neighborhoods with new insight. Written by resident expert Andrew Whitmarsh, this book
makes exploring Jakarta on foot fun, safe and easy.
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From reader reviews:

Carmine Adams:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
As it is known to us that book is very important normally. The book Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and around the
Indonesian Capital seemed to be making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take
more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The reserve Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and around the
Indonesian Capital is not only giving you more new information but also to be your friend when you sense
bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship using the book
Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and around the Indonesian Capital. You never sense lose out for everything in the
event you read some books.

Tom Scott:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and
around the Indonesian Capital, you may enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still desire to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its
called reading friends.

Nyla Gomez:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is just spending
your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books in the top
collection in your reading list is Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and around the Indonesian Capital. This book
which is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Edward Vogler:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
Through the book Jakarta: 25 Excursions in and around the Indonesian Capital we can take more advantage.
Don't you to be creative people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Only choose the best
book that appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life with this book Jakarta: 25
Excursions in and around the Indonesian Capital. You can more desirable than now.
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